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Agenda item #2  

RESOLUTION 
OF THE 

COMMONWEALTH TRANSPORTATION BOARD 

April 19, 2017 

MOTION 
Made By: Ms. Valentine, Seconded By:  Mr. Rosen 

Action:  Motion Carried, Unanimously   
 

Title:  “Roger Lee Floyd Memorial Bridge”  
Commemorative Naming of the bridge on Route 643, Wagon Trail Road, over Horsley 

Creek, Amherst County 
 
WHEREAS, the Amherst County Board of Supervisors wants to memorialize the life, 

service and sacrifice of PFC Roger Lee Floyd; and 
 
WHEREAS, in accordance with § 33.2-213 of the Code of Virginia, the Amherst County 

Board of Supervisors has requested, by resolution, that the Commonwealth Transportation 
Board, to memorialize the life and sacrifice of PFC Roger Lee Floyd, name the bridge on Route 
643, Wagon Trail Road, over Horsley Creek, Amherst County as the “Roger Lee Floyd 
Memorial Bridge”; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of Amherst County has agreed to reimburse the 

costs associated with providing and installing the necessary signs.  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, pursuant to § 33.2-213 of the Code of 

Virginia, the Commonwealth Transportation Board hereby names the bridge on Route 643, Wagon 
Trail Road, over Horsley Creek, Amherst County as the “Roger Lee Floyd Memorial Bridge”; 
and  

 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the Department of Transportation is hereby directed to 

fabricate and erect appropriate signs and to invoice Amherst County for the costs related to this 
commemorative naming.  
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CTB Decision Brief 
 

Bridge Naming: “Roger Lee Floyd Memorial Bridge” 
 
Issue:  Commemorative naming of the bridge on Route 643, Wagon Trail Road, over Horsley 
Creek, Amherst County.  

Facts:  Roger Lee Floyd was born and raised on his family farm in Amherst County.  While 
serving our country in the United States Army, Private First Class Roger Lee Floyd, First 
Infantry Division, fell in battle in Vietnam on November 12, 1965.  For his demonstrated 
heroism in ground combat on that day, PFC Floyd was awarded the Purple Heart and a Bronze 
Star Medal.  The First Infantry Division Cantigny War Memorial Museum of the First Division 
and the Society of the First Division awarded the Certificate of Recognition to PFC Floyd to 
commemorate his display of courage, valor and devotion to duty in combat service, without 
regard for the sacrifices and hardships endured.  He was also awarded a Certificate of Honorable 
Service as a mark of this country’s deep and respectful estimation of his faithful service to the 
United States of America. 

On January 17, 2017, the Amherst County Board of Supervisors, wishing to honor its native son 
with an enduring symbol of their deep affection for him and their abiding regard for his service, 
passed a resolution requesting the bridge located on Route 643, Wagon Trail Road, over 
Horsley Creek, be named the “Roger Lee Floyd Memorial Bridge”.   

Recommendations:  The Virginia Department of Transportation (VDOT) recommends this 
request be approved. 

Action Required by CTB:  The Code of Virginia requires a majority of the CTB members to 
approve a resolution naming the bridge.  A resolution will be provided for the Board’s 
consideration. 

Result if Approved:  The bridge located on Route 643, Wagon Trail Road, over Horsley Creek, 
will be known and signed as the “Roger Lee Floyd Memorial Bridge”.   

In accordance with law, the County will reimburse the costs associated with providing and 
installing the necessary signs and VDOT will invoice accordingly.  

Options: Approve, Deny, or Defer. 

Public Comments/Reactions: VDOT is not aware of any opposition to this proposal. 
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